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"If we see cruelty or wrong that we have the power to stop, and do nothing, we make ourselves sharers
in the guilt." --Anna Sewell, author of Black Beauty

Jo Anne Normile was not supposed to keep the foal, an exuberant Thoroughbred with only a few white hairs
on his reddish-brown forehead. But she fell in love with the young horse, who had literally been born into
her arms. The breeder finally said she could keep the colt, whom she nicknamed "Baby" – but only if she
raced him.

It was difficult to take Baby away from the safety of his pasture. But Normile had made a promise. Besides,
horseracing had always come across as a glamorous blend of mint juleps and celebrity, of equine grace and
speed. It was a vision she found appealing.

And she fell hard for it, this "Sport of Kings." She experienced a thrill every time Baby sprinted around the
track, edging out other horses. But the magic that enchants is a veneer. For every Seabiscuit, there are tens of
thousands of racehorses whose lives end in pain and despair, with indifference and corruption that runs
rampant through the world of horse racing.

Normile knew none of this. Not until an accident on a poorly maintained track. That's when everything
changed. That's when Normile founded the most successful horse rescue in the country, an organization that
would go on to save more horses than anyone else ever had. That's when she knew she had no other choice.

Saving Baby is Jo Anne Normile's story of perseverance and passion. A heartbreaking and ultimately life-
affirming book, it testifies to the transcending power of hope, and the unshakeable bond of love.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Stockton:

This Saving Baby: How One Woman's Love for a Racehorse Led to Her Redemption book is not ordinary
book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is
information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you read a lot
of information you will get. This kind of Saving Baby: How One Woman's Love for a Racehorse Led to Her
Redemption without we comprehend teach the one who looking at it become critical in imagining and
analyzing. Don't be worry Saving Baby: How One Woman's Love for a Racehorse Led to Her Redemption
can bring once you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in
your lovely laptop even cell phone. This Saving Baby: How One Woman's Love for a Racehorse Led to Her
Redemption having great arrangement in word and layout, so you will not experience uninterested in
reading.

Michael Turner:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity that is look different you can
read any book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the entire day to
reading a reserve. The book Saving Baby: How One Woman's Love for a Racehorse Led to Her Redemption
it is rather good to read. There are a lot of folks that recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. When you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy the e-book. You can
m0ore quickly to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book possesses
high quality.

Penny Stout:

This Saving Baby: How One Woman's Love for a Racehorse Led to Her Redemption is great reserve for you
because the content which can be full of information for you who all always deal with world and get to make
decision every minute. That book reveal it details accurately using great organize word or we can say no
rambling sentences within it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't
mean it only provides straight forward sentences but challenging core information with lovely delivering
sentences. Having Saving Baby: How One Woman's Love for a Racehorse Led to Her Redemption in your
hand like having the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no
publication that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen tiny right but this publication already do that. So ,
this can be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt in which?

Lashunda McCloud:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you go through



a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your research, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, along
with soon. The Saving Baby: How One Woman's Love for a Racehorse Led to Her Redemption will give
you new experience in examining a book.
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